PT. SCG LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE INDONESIA

( \4 JL. Surya Tekno KAV I-T1-3 Suryacipta City Of Industry,
W

Kutamekar, Ciampel Jawa Barat 41361 Indonesia

Phone : 0267-8610361
Fax : 0267-8610360
NP.W.P : 31.567.302.0-433.000
PURCHASE ORDER
To : CV.AYU GROUP PO No. : 4021013137
PERUM JOHAR PERMAI BLOK A/7 PO Date ©29.12.2022
JAWABARAT 41313 PO Currency : IDR
Indonesia
Phone : 02678490816
Fax :
N.P.WP : 316235860408000
Please supply the following item
No. Material Item Description Qty | Unit| Delivery | Unit Price Total Discount
Code Date Amount
10 Laporan # sorting product Uk. A4 15| RM 13.01.2023 75.000/ 1 1.125.000 0
HVS
20 Laporan #2 Sorting Product Uk. 10| RM 13.01.2023 75.000/1 750,000 0
Ad HVS
Delivery To ¢ PESLCI Total Prices 1,875,000
JL. Surya Tekno KAV I-T1-3 Suryacipta City Of Industry, PPN (VAT) 206,250
Karawang 41361 Indonesia Grand Total 2,081,250
Term of Payment: Credit 14 days after received bill
Remarks : NoPR: 1021012894

Barang yang tidak sesuai spesifikasi akan kami kembalikan.

Prepared By (hecked By Approved By Confirmed By (Vendor)

ZZ,ZZ'
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Price Investigation

Price Comparison Form

O

Raw Material D Services No. PC D2471
Acqusition by Tender
psleny e Supply I 1= o—
| | Made to Order
Last price / Standard Price CV Ayu Group Cipta Grafika Last Order
No. Description Quantity B Ao ¢/o Ms. Marjiono c/o Ms. Hany c/o Mr. Supplier :
Price Price Delivery Price Delivery  |Price Delivery | Price Date Remarks
1 |Laporan # sorting product Uk. A4 HVS 15| RM Rp1.125.000 Rp75.000 Rp20.000 Rp75.000 9/15/2021{CV Ayu Group
2 |Laporan #2 Sorting Product Uk. Ad HVS 10 RM Rp750.000 CV Ayu Group Rp75.000 Rp90.000 Rp75.000 9/15/2021|CV Ayu Group
Total Rpl.875.000
Verbal Price Investigation and Documented
Price Negotiation Reason : Repeat order Require Approval not to Sign Contract Because Good History Supplier
Price investigation and Verbal Offering Price
Documented price investigation and documented Offering
=pecial Arqusition LQ?}aJﬁaE Price / Former Price Prepared by : Commitee of Opening the S4 Acknowledge By, Acknowledge By,
Urgently Delive rice / Price Investigator | Sectipp Manager Plant Manager
Acquire From Specific Source il 5
Monaopoly

Acquire From Affiliate

D Urgently

PT SCG Lightweight Concrete Indonesia

Masa Simpan: 5 Tahun

Diki Seti
Date: 29-12-2022

F-PU-01-002; Rev. 0

03-Sep-18




12/29/22, 11:38 AM Purchase Request Check

= s N S S T YA —

PURCHASE REQUEST CHECK
APPROVAL
lTEM DESCR]PTION < Download PDF! (https://iot.slci.co.id/download_PR/1021012894) |
4
PR Number 11021012894
Total Price :IDR 2,000,000
Attachment : Click here (https://iot.slci.co.id/assets/lampiranpr/PR_1021012894.JPG)
Details PR
No. Item A Material Short Text Quantity Unit Delivery Plant Matl.Group PGR Value
Date
1 10 K Laporan #sorting 15 RM 29.12.2022 PT Supplies DBA 1,200,000
product SLCI
2 20 K Laporan #2 10 RM 29.12.2022 PT Supplies DBA 800,000
Sorting Product SLCI
Purpose:

[10] Sorting Report Document ALC Product
[20] Sorting Report Document ALC Product

GL: 523291
CC: 2011-10000

Dibuat Oleh, Checked by, Budget Control, Approved by,
90587(Taufik Hidayat) 90156(Mochamad 90696(Mukhtar L) 90156(Mochamad
2022-12-22 15:18:35 Nugrahaputra) Approved at 2022-12-26 Nugrahaputra)
Approved at 2022-12-23 16:50:56 Approved at 2022-12-28
16:36:34 17:36:47

https:/fiot.slci.co.id/checkPR/1021012894
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RE: Konfirmasi harga CV Ayu Group 140921

Subject: RE: Konfirmasi harga CV Ayu Group 140921

From: "Nassar Produksi Ayuprint" <produksi@ayuprint.co.id>
Date: 15/09/2021, 7:42

To: "'Diki Setiadi'™ <dikisetia@scg.com>

Selamat Pagi Pak Diki,
Cetakan tsh masih Harga Repeat Order Rp. 75.000/Rim
Kami tunggu POnya

Terimakasih

Nassar

From: Diki Setiadi [mailto:dikisetia@scg.com]

Sent: 14 September 2021 16:37

To: ayuprint@gmail.com; Nassar Nassruddin <produksi@ayuprint.co.id>

Cc: Yoki Radiansyah <yokiradi@scg.com>; Arfandi Kurniawan <arfandikurn@scg.com>
Subject: Konfirmasi harga CV Ayu Group 140921

Dear Pak Nassar

Kami rencana mau repeat order untuk item sbb:
1. Laporan # sorting product Uk. A4 HVS, Qty: 15Rm, Harga Rp. 75.000/Rm
2. Laporan #2 Sorting Product Uk. A4 HVS, Qty: 10Rm, Harga Rp. 75.000/Rm

Mohon konfirmasinya...

Thank you.

Best Regards
Diki S

Purchasing Dept.
PT SCG Lightweight Concrete Indonesia

Surya Cipta City Of Industry, Karawang, Indonesia
HP : +6281380082577
P: +62 267-8610361-2-3
F: +62 267-8610360

not the intended recipient, please immediately delete this e-mail from your system and notify the sender.
Any unauthorized usage of this e-mail may be subject to available legal proceeding. This e-mail may
contain personal opinion of the author or information that does not relate to the business of The Siam
Cement Plc., its affiliates and associates (“SCG”) for which SCG shall not be liable. It is advisable that all
e-mails be scanned by reliable virus protection software. SCG bears no responsibility for any damage

possibly incurred by this e-mail.

29/12/2022,13:13
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