PT INDOSERAKO SEJAHTERA

JI. PJAYAKARTA 121 No. 59, JAKARTA -PUSAT
Telp. (021) 6248923 (Hunting), 6299006, 6297262

Fax. (021) 6248922  Email : is0297 @dnet.net.id
QUOTATION
To : SCG LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE Date : 18/03/2022
Attn : MR. DIKI From : SINGGIH
Cc Your Ref
Subject  : Quotation
Fax : 0267-8610360 Our Ref  : 22/02529
Thank you for your inquiry and we are pleased to offer you as follows: Fage 2]
Item DESCRIPTION DELIVERY | QTY | UNIT | UNITPRICEinRp | TOTALinRp
1| 165938 Proximity IFM 4-6 WEEKS 3,00 UNIT | 940.000,00 2.820.000,00
2 | 01D100 Photoelectric IFM STOCK 1,00 UNIT |  5.750.000,00 5.750.000,00
SUBTOTAL 8.570.000,00
s PPN 10%in Rp 857.000,00
Term : 30 DAYS
Price + Franco JAKARTA TOTALin Rp 9.427.000,00
Validity ~ : 7 DAYS

Hope the above quotation meets your requirement. Looking forward to receive your
valuable order.

Best regards.

SINGGIH

Approved by:

CHANDRA



PT Raja Listrik Indonesia

PT Raja Listrik Indonesia

Ruko Golden Boulevard Blok C No.18,
BSD City,

Tangerang Selatan, Banten 15322

Invoicing address: ' Shipping address:

SCG LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE INDONESIA PT SCG LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE INDONESIA PT
Surya Cipta City Of Industry Surya Cipta City Of Industry

J.Surya Tekno Kav. I-T1-3 Kutamekar - Ciampel JI.Surya Tekno Kav. I-T1-3 Kutamekar - Ciampel
Karawang - Jawa Barat 41361 Karawang - Jawa Barat 41361

Indonesia Indonesia

. 0267-8610361/2/3
I8 0267-8610360

Nama Kontak : Jabatan Kontak : Telepon Kontak :
Diki (Mr.) Purchasing Dept 081380082577

QUOTATION # S0/2021/08385

Quotation Date: Expiration Date: Sales:
17/06/2021 10:30:25 22/06/2021 Era
Payment Terms:
30 Net Days
No. Description Delivery Quantity Unit Price Price
1. 1G5938/IGA3008-BPKG/US PROXIMITY SWITCH 1 Pcs: Ready To Prior Sales /1 Pcs : 2PCS 1,137,000.00 Rp 2,274,000.00
IFM 6-8 Weeks
2. 1G5842/IGA4008-CPKG/US-104 INDUCTIVE 4-6 Weeks 2PCS  1,190,000.00 Rp 2,380,000.00
SENSOR IFM
3. O1D100/0O1DLF2KG OPTICAL DISTAN CE Ready To Prior Sales 2 PCS 7,077,000.00 Rp 14,154,000.00
SENSOR IFM
4. EVCO05/ADOAH040MSS0005H04 5M SOCKET Ready To Prior Sales 2 PCS 457,000.00 Rp 914,000.00
IFM
Note's: Subtotal Rp 19,722,000.00
Franco : Jabotabek
Validity : 3 Days Taxes Rp 1,972,200.00
*Price Quoted with IDR Currency Total Rp 21,694,200.00

*Base on Euro/USD Currency, if Rate Up to 5% Will be Fallow the rate
*Cancellation PO/WO/SPK, 50% payment will be charge from the total PO
*Payment should be full amount

Phone: 021 - 5316 0700 =+ Fax:021-5386711 -+ Email: info@rajalistrik.co.id + Website: https://www.rajalistrik.com
Page: 1 / 1



Re: Permintaan Penawaran Harga HJS (PR 4345)

Subjek: Re: Permintaan Penawaran Harga HJS (PR 4345)
Dari: Rahmat - HJS <marketinghjs@imail.co.id>
Tanggal: 17/04/2018, 15:56

Kepada: Diki Setiadi <dikisetia@scg.com>

Selamat Siang Pak Diki
Terima kasih atas permintaan harga produk IFM kepada kami.
Berikut ini kami berikan penawaran harga terbaik kami dibawah ini :

IFM
IG5938 IGA3008-BPKG/US unit Price Rp 1,500,000.pc

Term and Condition :

Delivery Time : Within 6~8 Weeks after receive
Payment Term : 30 Days Balance before Shipment
Validity : 7 Days

Currency : Rupiah

Price : Franco Jakarta

Price : Exclude PPN 10%

Jika ada pertanyaan untuk keterangan lebih lanjut silahkan menghubungi kami.
Kami tunggu kabar baik dari Bapak secepatnya

Best Regards,

Rahmat Khoidir

Mobile :0812 8396 8279-8813 9902 6841
Pin BB :D821181E

PT. HIKMAH JAYA SENTOSA

J1. Puskesmas No 36 Kebagusan

Pasar Minggu Jakarta 12520 Indonesia
Telepon : +62-21 2278 3971-781 9193

Fax : +62-21 2270 1404

Email 21
Email
Web

tosa
Ltosa.

PLC, HMI, SERVO, VFD, SENSOR, SOFT STARTER:
OMRON, KEYENCE, TURCK, BANNER, MITSUBISHI,

BALLUFF, KOYO, IFM, ALLEN BRADLEY, SCHMERSAL,

SICK, METROL, PEPPERL + FUCHS, PANASONIC, KOBOLD,

DELTRON, FOTEK, FESTO, BOSCH REXROTH, ORIENTAL MOTOR,

PILZ, MURR ELECTRONIC, TRI-TRONICS, ENDRESS HAUSER,

SANWA DENKI (PRESSURE SWITCH), LEUZE, SCHNEIDER,

YASKAWA, ABB, OPTEX, YOKOGAWA, PARKER, IDEC, FUJI ELECTRIC,

BUSSMANN, AUTONICS, RELECO, YAMATAKE, PULS, FINETEK, A-RYUNG, MEANWELL,
NIDEC SHIMPO, LA-MAN

On 4/17/2018 3:24 PM, Diki Setiadi wrote:

| Dear Pak Rahmat

' Mohon dibuatkan penawaran harga untuk:
' 1. Sensor IFM 1G5938 IGA3008-BPKG/US

Thank you.

1 dari 2 21/03/2022,11:56



