To

Phone
IFax

N.P.W.

PT. SCG LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE INDONESIA

JL. Surya Tekno KAV I-T1-3 Suryacipta City Of Industry,
Kutamekar, Ciampel Jawa Barat 41361 Indonesia

Phone o 0267-8610361

lFax ¢ 0267-8610360

N.PW.P  : 31.567.302.0-433.000

PT. ASFERIC MITRA SEJATI

VILA GADING HARAPAN J-5 NO.8 RT.001
JAWA BARAT

Indonesia

6281284724707

P 766651822435000

Please supply the following item

PURCHASE ORDER

PO No. ¢ 4021012492
PO Date : 18.07.2022
PO Currency : IDR

No. Material Item Description Qty | Unit| Delivery | Unit Price Total Discount
Code Date Amount
10 Transportation Cost for Delivery 15(AU 31.07.2022 625,000/ 1 9,375,000 0
CSA
Delivery To & PISLECI Total Prices 9,375,000
JL. Surya Tekno KAV I-T1-3 Suryacipta City Of Industry, PPN (VAT) 1,031,250
Karawang 41361 Indonesia Grand Total 10,406,250

Term of Payment :  Credit 30 days after received bill
Remarks : PR 1021012208

Wajib mematuhi aturan keselamatan selama berada di PT.
Rute Karawang-Bekasi Kota
Harga sudah termasuk asuransi produk

SLCI

Prepared By hecked B Approved By
P = y Pp

Confirmed By (Vendor)

fetand,

[ = <
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PURCHASE REQUEST CHECK

APPROVAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION
PR Number 11021012208
Total Price :IDR 9,450,000
Attachment : Click here (https://iot.slci.co.id/assets/lampiranpr/PR_1021012208.JPG)
Details PR
No. Item A Material Short Text Quantity Unit Delivery Plant Matl.Group PGR Value
Date
1 10 R Transportation 15 AU 22.07.2022 PT Non Stock DBA 9,450,000
Cost for Delivery SLCI Service
CSA
Purpose:

[10] For delivery product ALC CSA route karawang-bekasi

GL: 601410
CC: Please Select Cost Center

Dibuat Oleh, Checked by, Budget Control, Approved by,
90473(Wahyu Pebriyanto) 90156(Mochamad 90696(Mukhtar L) 90005(Vorapong Panavasu)
2022-07-08 18:02:20 Nugrahaputra) Approved at 2022-07-14 Approved at 2022-07-18
Approved at 2022-07-12 15:57:19 10:16:27

15:06:28



PT. ASFERIC MITRA SEJATI

Parumahan Villa Gading Harapan Blok J6 Ko @ BT 001/ KW 036
Ujung Harapan Kel Bahagia Kee. Babelan Bokast Utara
Telp. 0812 8472 4707, OBT8 BB66 3610
E-mail : asfericmitrasojati26@gmail com

Bekasi, 8 July 2022

Kepada Yth,

1BU ROSSITA

Mgr Administration Dept SLCI (081991025258)
T.SCG LIGHTWEIGHT cnucaa'rnlnnuunsm




From: Chompoonut Practanarie 1 - Champoprétacg com
Sent: Mooday, 30 May 202 14 21

To: Rossita Sunatra <o sinas s Boeanmes, Wawan Fliman Herawan <wawrhemse B.eoms

CexFebriandy Galih Gupnilang - febnandy@@scg.coms, Precda Phothisuwan - preedpodsog coms; Sicawut Manee gl - STAWULI Eseg com s,
Pimchanok Sitthithesanond - pmchans@scg.comes; Sanny Christina ssannychranpt-kokoh coms: Khamisah Syabanioh
“Khomisaswscg.coms; Mohamad Rizky <mohamadriz@scp.com:: Attkam tmsap <atibomi@sep coms, Varapong Panavasu
“varaponuidseg comz, Mochamad Nugrahaputra < mochamnu@scg.com:; Rudiansyah aq - rudianaa@sege com s

Subject: RE: Price Route Karawany - Bekasi for PT CATUR SENTOSA ADIPRANA 1hk

Dear Bu Rossila
Confirmed. The rate ALC 6W routle KARAWANG — BEKAS! will be adjusted become 634,500 per (rip

The new rate will be affective from 15! of Jun 2022

Best regards,
Chompoonut P. (Pook)
PT. SCG Barito Logistics

From: Rossita Sunatra <rossitasi@scg.coms
Sent: 30 May, 2022 11:12

To: Chompoonut Practanarueang <chompopr@scg.com=>; Wawan Firman Herawan swawlithe@scg.coms

Ce: Febriandy Galih Gumilang ~febriandy@seg.com>; Preeda Phothisuwan <preedpo@scg.com:; Sirawut Maneerut <sirawitin @scp.coms;
Pimehanok Sitthithesanond <pimchans@scg.com>; Sanny Christina <sannychr@pt-kokoh.com=>: Khomisah Sya‘'baniah
<Khomisas@scg.com>; Mohamad Rizky <mohamadriz@scg.com>; Atikom lmsap <atikomif@scg.coms; Vorapong Panavasu
svoraponu@scg.coms; Mochamad Nugrahaputra <mochamnu@scg,.com»

Subject; Price Route Karawang - Bekasi for PT CATUR SENTOSA ADIPRANA Thk

Dear Pak Wawan
CC: Bu Pook

Based on information from Pak Atikom, there some changing price deduction for route Karawang Bekasi for Our customer PT
CATUR SENTOSA ADIPRANA Thk

Price :

Karawang - Bekasi : 635,520 / Trip

to be

Karawang - Bekasi : 634.520 / Trip

kindly inform your feedback for the price from SBL.
thank you

Rossita Sunatra (Ms.) | 11 850G Lightweight Conerete Indonesia
Surya Cipta City OF Indusiry, Karowang, Indonesia | M H62 NOR-7220-888 | P: 462 207-8610362-3 | F: 102 267560060

This e-mail contains legally protected intellectual property right and confidential information, If you are not the intended recipient, please
immediately delete this e-mail from your system and notify the sender. Any unauthorized usage of this e mail may be subject to available
legal proceeding. This e-mail may contain personal opinion of the author or Information that dees not relate to the business of The Siam
Cement Plc., its affiliates and associates (“SCG”) for which 5CG shall not be liable, It is advisable that all e-mails be scanned by reliable virus
protection software. SCG bears no responsibility for any damage possibly incurred by this e-mail,

This e-mail contains legally protected intellectual property right and confidential information. If you are not the intended
recipient, please immediately delete this e-mail from your system and notify the sender. Any unautherized usage of this e-mail
may be subject to available legal proceeding. This e-mail may contain personal opinion of the author or information that does
not relate to the business of The Siam Cement Plc, its affiliates and associates ("SCG") for which SCG shall not be liable. It i5
advisable that all e-mails be scanned by reliable virus protection software. SCG bears no responsibility for any damage

possibly incurred by this e-mail.

This e-mail contains legally protected intellectual property right and confidential information, If you are not the intended
recipient, please immediately delete this e-mail from your system and notify the sender. Any unauthorized usage of this e-mail



L, Beoli Vanvoneo
JLIaapang 4

Bandung 40262, Jawa Barat
Felepon @ 02227301924

lax : (122-7HMTSI
Nomor P I/BVCISPIVE2022
[ampiran 2 Lembar

Perihal Penawaran Harga
Kepada

Yth. Procurement

"1 SCG Hightweight Conerete Indonesia
Di

Tempat

Dengan Hormat,

Bersama surat ini kami bermaksud untuk mengajukan penawaran ongkos angkut bata
ringan dari lokasi pabrik PT SCG Lightweight Conerete Indonesia Karawang Timur
dengan tujuan bongkar ke area Kabupaten Bekasi. Berikut kami kivimkan spesifikasi
kendaraan kami:

Jumlah Dimensi

No Plat No Merk/Type Jenis Tahun e Truk Pxl

(meter)
IE D 9786 A | HINO/WUH342R-HKMTID3 (130111D) DUTRO 2015 4009 4.6m x 2m
2 D 9092 AG | THINO/WUS2R-TTEMTID3I (130H1D) DUTRO 2015 4009 4.6m x 2m
3. 19133 AG | HINO/WUSA2ZR-HTKMTID3 (130HD) DUTRO 2015 4009 4.6m x 2m

Mohon Kiranya diberi peluang dan kesempatan dalam berpartisipasi untuk jasa
angkut tersebut. Apabila diberi kepercayaan untuk mengajukan penawaran harga
angkut borongan sebesar Rp. 630.000/Truk/Trip. Bersama surat ini kami lampirkan
pula data STNK dan Kir truk yang bersangkutan.

Keterangan ;

. Pembayaran | (satu) bulan setelah invoice
Harga Sewaktu-waktu dapat berubah dengan adanya perubahan harga BBM
Pembayaran melalui transfer ke Bank BCA KCP Setiabudhi, Bandung No.
Rek. 2336998899 a.n P1. Benli Vanvonco.

2.
3

Demikian Surat Penawaran Harga ini kami buat. Atas Perhatian dan kerjasamanya
kami ucapkan Terima Kasih,

Bandung, 06 Juni 2022
PT. Benli Vanvgneo

——

ﬁm PT. BENLIVANVONCO
YL ]J JL. KATREANG No. 4
\.. # ANDUNG

eny 1-

(08122454428)

\



